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List of References for EPC Projects 
 
 

Customer Reference Site PC 
Year of 

Realization 

ETIHAD Sugar 
Refinery 

Planning, design, manufacture, erection and 
commissioning of source of processing steam and 
power for a sugar plant. 

Babylon  
/Iraq 

1 2018 

BARLINEK 
Inwestycje  
Sp. z o.o 

Planning, design, manufacture, erection and 
commissioning of source of processing steam and 
power for a company processing wood mass. 
Energy source includes 33 t/h boiler and steam 
turbine with power output 5,78 MWe. 

Barlinek 
/Poland 

1 2017/2018 

BIOMASS TO 
ENERGY 

BENKOVAC 
d.o.o.   

 
Energy source with power output 4,93 MW 
combusting wood chips and straw pellets. Planning, 
design, manufacture, erection and commissioning 26 
t/h steam boiler and 5,6 MWe condensing steam 
turbine. Range of scope of the delivery also includes 
technology projects, construction part, transport of 
fuel, cooling system, electric power lines and other 
parts necessary for full-fledged operation of power 
plant. 
 

Benkovac 
/Croatia 

1 2016/2017 

JAZAN Sugar 
Refeinery 

Turnkey EPC Project including 2 boilers 75t/h 
combusting heavy fuel oil, 2x 7 MW steam turbines, 
reducing station, complete electrical part and control 
system. It follows other successful references of 
EKOL company- NILE Sugar in Egypt and ETIHAD 
FOOD INDUSTRIES in Iraq. 

Saudi Arabia 1 2016/2017 

ETIHAD Sugar 
Refinery 

Planning, design, manufacture, erection and 
commissioning of source of processing steam and 
power for a sugar plant 

Babylon 

/Iraq 
1 2014 

THERMAL 
PLANT 

LOUČOVICE, 
a.s. 

Planning, design, manufacture, erection and 
commissioning of Biomass Power Plant including 7,5 
MW backpressure steam turbine with generator, 
type specification K7,5-6,5/1,0 

Loučovice  
/Czech Republic 

1 2013 

VEOLIA 
Energie ČR, 

Frýdek-Místek 

Planning, design, manufacture, erection and 
commissioning of Biomass Power Plant including,8 
MWe backpressure steam turbine with generator, 
type specification R5,8 – 6,2/0,04-0 

Sviadnov  
/Czech Republic 

1 2012 
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BELARUSKAL
I RU2 

Planning, design, manufacture, erection and 
commissioning of source of power output 7,2 MWe 
and heat in form of steam 15 t/h and flue gas 

Soligors 

/Belarus 
1 2011 

Nile Sugar Co. 

Planning, design, manufacture, erection and 
commissioning of source of processing steam 160 
t/h and power output 16 MWe for power a sugar 
plant 

Alexandrie 

/Egypt 
1 2010 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 


